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Chelsy Ao Haru Ride Insert Song I Will [FLAC] Rarl. What I said before, what I've been
trying to say. Make sure that your songs are being put out online. On The Internet, it
really doesn't matter what you post or not. Other people can hear it, right? So if you
don't post your songs online then no one can hear them. They've already been heard
by everyone. I'm sure if your song is better than that, you know, I'm sure you can find
someone who'll listen to it. People just don't like what they already heard. >Nate:
That's the thing, I don't like what people have already heard. >I do not want people to
hear it. I like my music to be quiet. I like it when no one's listening. >Nate: Because
then I can really feel like they're there, you know, like they're there with me. >Nate: I
like it when I'm the only one listening to my music. >I like when I'm the only one
listening to my music. It's just me and my music. >Nate: I'm not used to doing it.
When I do record, I'm always recording someone else. I'm not used to doing this by
myself, doing it all alone. >When I don't have anyone to record, I have to make sure
that it's quiet. >I know, but when I do it by myself, I don't care what other people say.
If someone's heard it and they don't like it, that's it, right? Then I don't even want
them to have heard it. So I have to be really careful about that. It's not just music, this
is my life. It's not something that can be tossed out. >Nate: I know, I know. >I want to
listen to it, but I want it to be quiet. >Nate: When I'm recording, I just want to make it
quiet. So that I can really hear it. That's all. >I know, I know, I know. >I need to listen
to it like it's silent, I know that. >I just want to hear my own music. >I know, I know, I
know. >Nate: I'm gonna listen to it right now. I'm gonna listen to it, not just record it.
>My mom will not be here, it's gonna be all right. >I want to listen to my music. I need
to listen to my music. >I need to listen to my music. >It's gonna be okay. >I want to
listen to it. I
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